
Year 8 Term 1 

If you have completed all your science homework set by your teacher, you can choose from this grid 

Draw a comic strip about the 
journey of a pizza through 
your digestive system as it is 
eaten. 

Make a board game on one 
topic studied this term. 

Research 3 animals that 
became extinct. Why did it 
happen? 

Make a model of a heart, 
labelling its key features. 

Make a list of all the acids and 
alkalis you can find in your 
house. 

Describe how farmers 
neutralise acidic soils to 
increase crop production. 

Keep a food diary and analyse 
your diet over a week. Is it 
balanced? What changes do 
you need to make? 

Who were Lamarck and 
Darwin? Describe the key 
points of their theories. 

Make a timeline for the 
evolution of humans. 

Draw a poster to encourage 
good health through nutrition. 

Look at photographs of your 
relatives.  Can you identify any 
inherited features in your 
family? 

Watch a documentary on 
evolution and write a review 
on it. 


