
 Year 7 Term 3 

If you have completed all your science homework set by your teacher, you can choose from this grid 

 

Research insect pollinators.  
Why are they so important to 
the human race? 

Find some tricks that involve 
refraction and practise them 
on your family. 

Make a model of an ear. Label 
the key parts and describe 
their role. 

Go for a walk and make a list 
of all the elements, 
compounds and mixtures you 
see. 

Write a biography for Dmitri 
Mendeleev. 

Design a poster to stop 
women smoking and drinking 
alcohol through pregnancy. 

Write a guide for teenagers on 
how the human body changes 
through puberty. 

Design a board game on the 
decibel scale 

Take photographs of flowers 
and label the photographs 
with the names of the 
reproductive organs. 

Describe two specialised cells 
involved in human 
reproduction. 

Watch the elements song on 
youtube  - can you do it? 

Use a mirror to try to write in 
reverse. 


